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THE STAR 

A way out of 
the Arai d 

crisis 
The generation that had split 

the atom had to find a new way to 
help itself in the present world 
crisis, and that way was moral 
rearmament, Mr. Bremer Hofmeyr, 
South African leader of the Moral 
Rearmament movement, told a 
well-attended meeting ,in the Sel- 
borne Hall last night. 	, 
Mr. Hofmeyr said the, present , 

world crisis was one of a struggle 
of ideas. Nations were arming in 
an atomic age. What was needed 
was a great uniting idea, an idea 
which would be big enough for 
all. 
Moral Rearmament gave every 

person a chance to "get into the 
fight" and build a worid free from 
hate and fear. 
It stood for changes and if it 

were to succeed these would have 
to be made. Love-, security, and 
freedom were some of the ideolo-
gies ,of Moral Rearmament. 

IN THE FAR EAST 
Not until there was a new 

world with new ideas would there 
be an answer to Communism into 
which Moral.  Rearmament was 
already penetrating. In the Far 
East it was spreading and five 
of the seven Japanese signatories 
to the recent peace treaty were 
actively interested. 
Mr. Acting Justice C. J. Claas-

sen said that Natives were saying 
that without Moral Rearmament 
the future of the country looked 
far from favourable. The right 
ideology, Moral Rearmament, was 
needed to bring about agreement 
between the two races of Africa,, 
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